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 # AWARD
Armstrong 

Rentals, LLC

AWARD
Atkinson Sand & 

Gravel, Inc

AWARD
D & L Sand and 

Gravel LLC

AWARD
Deweese Sand 

& Gravel

Ed Broadfoot & 
Sons Sand & 

Gravel

Elkhorn Sand & 
Gravel LLC

Description Qty UO
M  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

1 DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
WAHOO YARD 1200 TN  $              30.00 

2 DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
EAST JCT HWY 15 AND 92 1500 TN  $              27.50 

3 DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
PALMYRA YARD 1500 TN  $              27.25 

4 DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL 
JCT HWY 8 AND 65 PAWNEE CITY 1500 TN  $              26.25 

5 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
NELIGH YARD 2800 TN  No Bid 

6 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY57 8MI OF STANTON 1500 TN  No Bid 

7 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY121 JCT 121 AND 32 2200 TN  No Bid 

8 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY13 4MI N OF PIERCE 750 TN  No Bid 

9 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 
FULLERTON MAINT YARD 500 TN  No Bid 

10 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
ORD MAINT YARD 500 TN  No Bid 

11 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 
GREELEY YARD 300 TN  No Bid 

12 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
ST PAUL MAINT YARD 1000 TN  No Bid  $              11.21 

13 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
LOUP CITY YARD 700 TN  No Bid  $              21.25 

14 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
HWY14 MP60 3MI S  AURORA 1000 TN  No Bid  $                9.55 

15 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
JCT 34 AND 81 2MI N OF YORK 1200 TN  No Bid 

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel
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 # AWARD
Armstrong 

Rentals, LLC

AWARD
Atkinson Sand & 

Gravel, Inc

AWARD
D & L Sand and 

Gravel LLC

AWARD
Deweese Sand 

& Gravel

Ed Broadfoot & 
Sons Sand & 

Gravel

Elkhorn Sand & 
Gravel LLC

Description Qty UO
M  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

16 DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY6 
MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 500 TN  No Bid 

17 DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
LOUP CITY YARD 500 TN  No Bid  $              25.00 

18 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 500 TN  No Bid  $              10.04 

19 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY281 MP7 2MI N OF RED CLOUD 1420 TN  $              19.00  $              13.84 

20 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 
RAVENNA YARD 680 TN  No Bid  $              12.50  $              15.56 

21 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY281 MP95 1MI N OF ST PAUL 1000 TN  No Bid  $              11.35 

22 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY58 MP29 1MI N OF ROCKVILLE 1100 TN  No Bid  $              18.77 

23 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP320 1MI W OF LOUP CITY 550 TN  No Bid  $              19.76 

24 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL 
HARRISBURG YARD 2000 TN  No Bid 

25 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL 
CHAPPELL YARD 1000 TN  No Bid 

26 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
KIMBALL YARD 3000 TN  No Bid 

27 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
SIDNEY MAINT YARD 3000 TN  No Bid 

28 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
ALLIANCE YARD 1200 TN  No Bid 

29 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HARRISON YARD 2000 TN  No Bid 

30 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
CRAWFORD YARD 2000 TN  No Bid 



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
Department of Transportation

Opening Date:  02/06/20 

Page 3 of 32

Li
ne

 # AWARD
Armstrong 

Rentals, LLC

AWARD
Atkinson Sand & 

Gravel, Inc

AWARD
D & L Sand and 

Gravel LLC

AWARD
Deweese Sand 

& Gravel

Ed Broadfoot & 
Sons Sand & 

Gravel

Elkhorn Sand & 
Gravel LLC

Description Qty UO
M  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

31 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY20 MP75 15MI E OF CHADRON 4000 TN  No Bid 

32 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY20 MP92 1MI E OF RUSHVILLE 1000 TN  No Bid 

33
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY71 MP110 26MI S OF CRAWFORD 3000 TN  No Bid 

34 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
HWY250 MP37 11MI S OF RUSHVILLE 1500 TN  No Bid 

35 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY385 MP149 18MI S OF CHADRON 2000 TN  No Bid 

36 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY385 MP141 26MI S OF CHADRON 2000 TN  No Bid 

37 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY26 MP88 2MI W OF LISCO 3000 TN  No Bid 

38 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY27 MP109 9MI S OF OSHKOSH 2000 TN  No Bid 

39 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY27 MP118 1MI S OF OSHKOSH 3000 TN  No Bid 

40 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY29 MP36 24MI N OF MITCHELL 1500 TN  No Bid 

41 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HARRISBURG YARD 1500 TN  No Bid 

42 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY71 MP90 27MI N OF 2000 TN  No Bid 

43 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY92 MP21 2MI W OF 1500 TN  No Bid 

44 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
KIMBALL YARD 3000 TN  No Bid 

45 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY27 MP92 10MI E OF CHAPPELL 2000 TN  No Bid 
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 # AWARD
Armstrong 

Rentals, LLC

AWARD
Atkinson Sand & 

Gravel, Inc

AWARD
D & L Sand and 

Gravel LLC

AWARD
Deweese Sand 

& Gravel

Ed Broadfoot & 
Sons Sand & 

Gravel

Elkhorn Sand & 
Gravel LLC

Description Qty UO
M  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

46 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY30 MP55 3MI W OF SIDNEY 2000 TN  No Bid 

47 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY71 MP3 12S OF KIMBALL 2000 TN  No Bid 

48 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD 1000 TN  No Bid 

49 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
NORTH PLATTE I-80 YARD 1000 TN  No Bid 

50 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
SUTHERLAND MAINT YARD 1000 TN  No Bid 

51 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
ANSLEY MAINT YARD 1500 TN  No Bid 

52 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
OCONTO MAINT YARD 1500 TN  No Bid 

53 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
ARNOLD HWY92  MP251 1500 TN  No Bid 

54 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 1500 TN  No Bid 

55 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN 500 TN  No Bid 

56 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
ANSLEY HWY183 MP89 500 TN  No Bid 

57 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 500 TN  No Bid 

58 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY21 MP12 1MI N OF LEXINGTON 1000 TN  No Bid 

59 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY21 MP37 12MI N OF OCONTO 1000 TN  No Bid 

60 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN 1000 TN  No Bid 
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 # AWARD
Armstrong 

Rentals, LLC

AWARD
Atkinson Sand & 

Gravel, Inc

AWARD
D & L Sand and 

Gravel LLC

AWARD
Deweese Sand 

& Gravel

Ed Broadfoot & 
Sons Sand & 

Gravel

Elkhorn Sand & 
Gravel LLC

Description Qty UO
M  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

61 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY97 MP9 12MI N OF N PLATTE 2000 TN  No Bid 

62 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY23 MP56 DICKENS 2000 TN  No Bid 

63 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
GOTHENBURG YARD 750 TN  No Bid 

64 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
ANSLEY HWY183 MP89 750 TN  No Bid 

65 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
SARGENT YARD 750 TN  No Bid 

66 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
OCONTO JCT HWY21 AND 40 750 TN  No Bid 

67 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
ARNOLD HWY92  MP251 375 TN  No Bid 

68 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
ANSELMO HWY2 MP257 750 TN  No Bid 

69 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
BROKEN BOW HWY21 MP68 750 TN  No Bid 

70 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY2 AT DUNNING 750 TN  No Bid 

71 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY25 MP104 AT SUTHERLAND 2000 TN  No Bid 

72 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
LEXINGTON YARD 750 TN  No Bid 

73 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN 2500 TN  No Bid 

74 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON 2000 TN  No Bid 

75 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY83 MP130 18MI N STAPLETON 1000 TN  No Bid 
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 # AWARD
Armstrong 

Rentals, LLC

AWARD
Atkinson Sand & 

Gravel, Inc

AWARD
D & L Sand and 

Gravel LLC

AWARD
Deweese Sand 

& Gravel

Ed Broadfoot & 
Sons Sand & 

Gravel

Elkhorn Sand & 
Gravel LLC

Description Qty UO
M  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

76 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON 500 TN  No Bid 

77 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY2 MP176 10MI W OF MULLEN 1000 TN  No Bid 

78 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY61 MP126 1MI N ARTHUR 1000 TN  No Bid 

79 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY61 MP175 13MI N OF HYANNIS 1000 TN  No Bid 

80 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY61 MP131 7MI N ARTHUR 1000 TN  No Bid 

81 DIST 7 SURFACING GRAVEL 
HWY23 MP131 W END OF ELWOOD 1150 TN  No Bid  $              21.49 

82 DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY6 MP10 13MI W OF IMPERIAL 700 TN  No Bid 

83 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
SPRINGVIEW YARD 800 TN  No Bid  $              14.50  $              16.86 

84 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
AINSWORTH YARD 1500 TN  No Bid  $                9.90  $                9.50  $              14.65 

85 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
VALENTINE YARD 2000 TN  No Bid  $              20.00  $              12.25  $              22.30 

86 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
CODY YARD 500 TN  No Bid  $              24.00  $              17.70 

87 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
MERRIMAN YARD 2000 TN  No Bid  $              30.00  $              20.95 

88 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
HWY11 MP147 AT ATKINSON 500 TN  No Bid  $                8.00  $              12.60 

89 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
SPENCER YARD 500 TN  No Bid  $              10.25  $              15.50 

90 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
NORTH SPENCER YARD HWY281 700 TN  No Bid  $              11.00  $              16.35 
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 # AWARD
Armstrong 

Rentals, LLC

AWARD
Atkinson Sand & 

Gravel, Inc

AWARD
D & L Sand and 

Gravel LLC

AWARD
Deweese Sand 

& Gravel

Ed Broadfoot & 
Sons Sand & 

Gravel

Elkhorn Sand & 
Gravel LLC

Description Qty UO
M  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

91 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
BURWELL SOUTH YARD 1000 TN  No Bid  $              18.00 

92 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
BARTLETT YARD 2000 TN  No Bid  $              19.00 

93 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
TAYLOR YARD 1000 TN  No Bid 

94 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
O'NEILL YARD 1000 TN  No Bid  $                8.90  $              12.00 

95 DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY11 MP185 N OF BUTTE 2000 TN  No Bid  $              11.50  $              17.20 

96 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL 
SPRINGVIEW YARD 1000 TN  No Bid  $              14.00  $              11.10  $              15.35 

97 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY20 MP135 1MI W OF MERRIMAN 1200 TN  No Bid  $              30.00  $              20.45 

98 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY12 MP81 N BROCKSBURG 700 TN  No Bid  $              12.00  $              13.20 

99 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY12 MP102  8MI E OF NAPER 350 TN  No Bid  $              11.50  $              12.80 

100 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY281 MP212 AT SPENCER 350 TN  No Bid  $                9.50  $              16.80 

101 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY11 MP91 S OF BURWELL 700 TN  No Bid  $              13.12 

102 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY20 MP165 6MI E OF CODY 600 TN  No Bid  $              26.25  $              16.90 

103 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY12 MP19 1MI E OF SPARKS 600 TN  No Bid  $              19.70  $              16.50  $              16.80 

104 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY20 MP202 6MI E OF VALENTINE 1200 TN  No Bid  $              19.80  $              12.00  $              21.30 

105 OPTION 1: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
ARMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS

200 TN  No Bid  $                0.18  $                    -    $                0.20 



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
Department of Transportation

Opening Date:  02/06/20 

Page 8 of 32

Li
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 # AWARD
Armstrong 

Rentals, LLC

AWARD
Atkinson Sand & 

Gravel, Inc

AWARD
D & L Sand and 

Gravel LLC

AWARD
Deweese Sand 

& Gravel

Ed Broadfoot & 
Sons Sand & 

Gravel

Elkhorn Sand & 
Gravel LLC

Description Qty UO
M  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

106 OPTION 2: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 

200 TN  No Bid  $                0.18  $                0.15  $                    -    $                0.20  $                0.17 

107 OPTION 3: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
WINDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 

200 TN  No Bid  $                0.18  $                0.15  $                    -    $                0.20  $                0.17 

108 OPTION 4: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
SURFACING GRAVEL/ LOCATIONS 

200 TN  No Bid  $                0.18  $                    -    $                0.20  $                0.17 

109 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY281 MP120 2MI N OF GREELEY 1200 TN  No Bid 

0 30 Net 30 100 30 Net 40 100 30 0 90
14 15 60 30

Lines 105-108 
are per Ton/Mile

Lines 106-108 
are per Ton Mile

 Award Explanation 
 The State has opted to award line 2 to Armstrong 
Rentals LLC due to it being a one line contract. 
Therefore, the State is consolidating that line into a 
larger contract.  

Total

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
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Description Qty UO
M

1 DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
WAHOO YARD 1200 TN

2 DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
EAST JCT HWY 15 AND 92 1500 TN

3 DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
PALMYRA YARD 1500 TN

4 DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL 
JCT HWY 8 AND 65 PAWNEE CITY 1500 TN

5 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
NELIGH YARD 2800 TN

6 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY57 8MI OF STANTON 1500 TN

7 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY121 JCT 121 AND 32 2200 TN

8 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY13 4MI N OF PIERCE 750 TN

9 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 
FULLERTON MAINT YARD 500 TN

10 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
ORD MAINT YARD 500 TN

11 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 
GREELEY YARD 300 TN

12 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
ST PAUL MAINT YARD 1000 TN

13 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
LOUP CITY YARD 700 TN

14 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
HWY14 MP60 3MI S  AURORA 1000 TN

15 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
JCT 34 AND 81 2MI N OF YORK 1200 TN

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

AWARD
Emme Sand & 

Gravel, Inc.

AWARD
Hooker Bros 

Sand & Gravel 
Inc 

AWARD
Island 

Landhandlers

AWARD
Jeffres Sand & 

Gravel Inc.

AWARD
L & L Gravel

L.P. Stewart and 
Sons

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $              47.25 

 $              53.75 

 $              15.65  $              16.28  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $              18.50  No Bid 

 $              14.75  No Bid 

 $              11.00  No Bid 

 $              15.10  $              14.25  No Bid 

 $                9.70  $                9.85  No Bid 

 $              14.10  No Bid 

 $                9.88  $                9.25  No Bid 

 $              10.84  $              13.75  No Bid 
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Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

16 DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY6 
MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 500 TN

17 DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
LOUP CITY YARD 500 TN

18 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 500 TN

19 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY281 MP7 2MI N OF RED CLOUD 1420 TN

20 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 
RAVENNA YARD 680 TN

21 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY281 MP95 1MI N OF ST PAUL 1000 TN

22 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY58 MP29 1MI N OF ROCKVILLE 1100 TN

23 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP320 1MI W OF LOUP CITY 550 TN

24 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL 
HARRISBURG YARD 2000 TN

25 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL 
CHAPPELL YARD 1000 TN

26 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
KIMBALL YARD 3000 TN

27 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
SIDNEY MAINT YARD 3000 TN

28 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
ALLIANCE YARD 1200 TN

29 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HARRISON YARD 2000 TN

30 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
CRAWFORD YARD 2000 TN

AWARD
Emme Sand & 

Gravel, Inc.

AWARD
Hooker Bros 

Sand & Gravel 
Inc 

AWARD
Island 

Landhandlers

AWARD
Jeffres Sand & 

Gravel Inc.

AWARD
L & L Gravel

L.P. Stewart and 
Sons

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              15.80  $              16.50  No Bid 

 $              18.50  $              16.75  No Bid 

 $              10.52  No Bid 

 $              14.69  No Bid 

 $              10.73  $              14.95  No Bid 

 $                9.57  No Bid 

 $              14.50  No Bid 

 $              13.75  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $              21.55  No Bid 

 $              24.55  No Bid 
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Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

31 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY20 MP75 15MI E OF CHADRON 4000 TN

32 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY20 MP92 1MI E OF RUSHVILLE 1000 TN

33
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY71 MP110 26MI S OF CRAWFORD 3000 TN

34 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
HWY250 MP37 11MI S OF RUSHVILLE 1500 TN

35 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY385 MP149 18MI S OF CHADRON 2000 TN

36 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY385 MP141 26MI S OF CHADRON 2000 TN

37 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY26 MP88 2MI W OF LISCO 3000 TN

38 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY27 MP109 9MI S OF OSHKOSH 2000 TN

39 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY27 MP118 1MI S OF OSHKOSH 3000 TN

40 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY29 MP36 24MI N OF MITCHELL 1500 TN

41 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HARRISBURG YARD 1500 TN

42 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY71 MP90 27MI N OF 2000 TN

43 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY92 MP21 2MI W OF 1500 TN

44 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
KIMBALL YARD 3000 TN

45 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY27 MP92 10MI E OF CHAPPELL 2000 TN

AWARD
Emme Sand & 

Gravel, Inc.

AWARD
Hooker Bros 

Sand & Gravel 
Inc 

AWARD
Island 

Landhandlers

AWARD
Jeffres Sand & 

Gravel Inc.

AWARD
L & L Gravel

L.P. Stewart and 
Sons

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              31.00  No Bid 

 $              32.50  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $              31.15  No Bid 

 $              31.00  No Bid 

 $              31.00  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $              17.10  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 
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Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

46 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY30 MP55 3MI W OF SIDNEY 2000 TN

47 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY71 MP3 12S OF KIMBALL 2000 TN

48 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD 1000 TN

49 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
NORTH PLATTE I-80 YARD 1000 TN

50 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
SUTHERLAND MAINT YARD 1000 TN

51 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
ANSLEY MAINT YARD 1500 TN

52 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
OCONTO MAINT YARD 1500 TN

53 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
ARNOLD HWY92  MP251 1500 TN

54 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 1500 TN

55 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN 500 TN

56 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
ANSLEY HWY183 MP89 500 TN

57 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 500 TN

58 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY21 MP12 1MI N OF LEXINGTON 1000 TN

59 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY21 MP37 12MI N OF OCONTO 1000 TN

60 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN 1000 TN

AWARD
Emme Sand & 

Gravel, Inc.

AWARD
Hooker Bros 

Sand & Gravel 
Inc 

AWARD
Island 

Landhandlers

AWARD
Jeffres Sand & 

Gravel Inc.

AWARD
L & L Gravel

L.P. Stewart and 
Sons

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $              10.00  No Bid 

 $              10.50  No Bid 

 $                9.00  No Bid 

 $              11.15  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $              14.20  No Bid 

 $              14.40  No Bid 

 $              14.87  $              11.50  No Bid 

 $              14.85  No Bid 

 $              17.90  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $              18.87  $              14.50  No Bid 



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
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 #

Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

61 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY97 MP9 12MI N OF N PLATTE 2000 TN

62 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY23 MP56 DICKENS 2000 TN

63 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
GOTHENBURG YARD 750 TN

64 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
ANSLEY HWY183 MP89 750 TN

65 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
SARGENT YARD 750 TN

66 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
OCONTO JCT HWY21 AND 40 750 TN

67 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
ARNOLD HWY92  MP251 375 TN

68 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
ANSELMO HWY2 MP257 750 TN

69 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
BROKEN BOW HWY21 MP68 750 TN

70 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY2 AT DUNNING 750 TN

71 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY25 MP104 AT SUTHERLAND 2000 TN

72 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
LEXINGTON YARD 750 TN

73 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN 2500 TN

74 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON 2000 TN

75 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY83 MP130 18MI N STAPLETON 1000 TN

AWARD
Emme Sand & 

Gravel, Inc.

AWARD
Hooker Bros 

Sand & Gravel 
Inc 

AWARD
Island 

Landhandlers

AWARD
Jeffres Sand & 

Gravel Inc.

AWARD
L & L Gravel

L.P. Stewart and 
Sons

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              13.75  No Bid 

 $              15.10  No Bid 

 $              16.30  No Bid 

 $              11.50  No Bid 

 $              11.00  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $              17.20  No Bid 

 $              12.80  No Bid 

 $              15.20  No Bid 

 $              11.60  $              11.50  No Bid 

 $              12.50  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $              17.75  $              11.00  No Bid 

 $              15.92  No Bid 

 $              17.60  $              11.50  No Bid 



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
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 #

Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

76 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON 500 TN

77 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY2 MP176 10MI W OF MULLEN 1000 TN

78 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY61 MP126 1MI N ARTHUR 1000 TN

79 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY61 MP175 13MI N OF HYANNIS 1000 TN

80 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY61 MP131 7MI N ARTHUR 1000 TN

81 DIST 7 SURFACING GRAVEL 
HWY23 MP131 W END OF ELWOOD 1150 TN

82 DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY6 MP10 13MI W OF IMPERIAL 700 TN

83 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
SPRINGVIEW YARD 800 TN

84 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
AINSWORTH YARD 1500 TN

85 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
VALENTINE YARD 2000 TN

86 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
CODY YARD 500 TN

87 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
MERRIMAN YARD 2000 TN

88 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
HWY11 MP147 AT ATKINSON 500 TN

89 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
SPENCER YARD 500 TN

90 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
NORTH SPENCER YARD HWY281 700 TN

AWARD
Emme Sand & 

Gravel, Inc.

AWARD
Hooker Bros 

Sand & Gravel 
Inc 

AWARD
Island 

Landhandlers

AWARD
Jeffres Sand & 

Gravel Inc.

AWARD
L & L Gravel

L.P. Stewart and 
Sons

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              15.42  $              13.00  No Bid 

 $              19.10  $              12.50  No Bid 

 $              20.08  No Bid 

 $              23.65  $              16.50  No Bid 

 $              20.70  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $              23.50  No Bid 

 $              14.50  No Bid 

 $              12.00  No Bid 

 $              15.00  No Bid 

 $              17.75  No Bid 

 $              22.50  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $              11.05  No Bid 

 $              11.05  No Bid 
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 #

Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

91 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
BURWELL SOUTH YARD 1000 TN

92 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
BARTLETT YARD 2000 TN

93 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
TAYLOR YARD 1000 TN

94 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
O'NEILL YARD 1000 TN

95 DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY11 MP185 N OF BUTTE 2000 TN

96 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL 
SPRINGVIEW YARD 1000 TN

97 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY20 MP135 1MI W OF MERRIMAN 1200 TN

98 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY12 MP81 N BROCKSBURG 700 TN

99 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY12 MP102  8MI E OF NAPER 350 TN

100 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY281 MP212 AT SPENCER 350 TN

101 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY11 MP91 S OF BURWELL 700 TN

102 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY20 MP165 6MI E OF CODY 600 TN

103 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY12 MP19 1MI E OF SPARKS 600 TN

104 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY20 MP202 6MI E OF VALENTINE 1200 TN

105 OPTION 1: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
ARMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS

200 TN

AWARD
Emme Sand & 

Gravel, Inc.

AWARD
Hooker Bros 

Sand & Gravel 
Inc 

AWARD
Island 

Landhandlers

AWARD
Jeffres Sand & 

Gravel Inc.

AWARD
L & L Gravel

L.P. Stewart and 
Sons

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              11.50  No Bid 

 $              11.30  $              10.70  No Bid 

 $              11.50  No Bid 

 $                9.70  No Bid 

 $              13.80  No Bid 

 $              11.75  No Bid 

 $              24.00  No Bid 

 $              10.75  No Bid 

 $              10.75  No Bid 

 $              10.75  No Bid 

 $              11.50  No Bid 

 $              22.50  No Bid 

 $              19.50  No Bid 

 $              14.00  No Bid 

 $                0.15  $                0.18  $                0.15  No Bid 



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
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 #

Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

106 OPTION 2: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 

200 TN

107 OPTION 3: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
WINDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 

200 TN

108 OPTION 4: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
SURFACING GRAVEL/ LOCATIONS 

200 TN

109 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY281 MP120 2MI N OF GREELEY 1200 TN

Total

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

AWARD
Emme Sand & 

Gravel, Inc.

AWARD
Hooker Bros 

Sand & Gravel 
Inc 

AWARD
Island 

Landhandlers

AWARD
Jeffres Sand & 

Gravel Inc.

AWARD
L & L Gravel

L.P. Stewart and 
Sons

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $                0.15  $                0.18  $                0.15  No Bid 

 $                0.15  $                0.15  No Bid 

 $                0.15  $                0.15  $                0.16  No Bid 

 $              14.80  $              14.50  $                0.16  No Bid 

0 0 No discounts 30 Net 30 100 30
15 30  As Requested 10 5

Lines 105-108:
 .$15/Ton Mile * 

10 Miles = 
$1.50/Ton

 Award Explanation 
 The State has opted to award line 2 to Armstrong 
Rentals LLC due to it being a one line contract. 
Therefore, the State is consolidating that line into a 
larger contract.  
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 #

Description Qty UO
M

1 DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
WAHOO YARD 1200 TN

2 DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
EAST JCT HWY 15 AND 92 1500 TN

3 DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
PALMYRA YARD 1500 TN

4 DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL 
JCT HWY 8 AND 65 PAWNEE CITY 1500 TN

5 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
NELIGH YARD 2800 TN

6 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY57 8MI OF STANTON 1500 TN

7 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY121 JCT 121 AND 32 2200 TN

8 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY13 4MI N OF PIERCE 750 TN

9 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 
FULLERTON MAINT YARD 500 TN

10 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
ORD MAINT YARD 500 TN

11 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 
GREELEY YARD 300 TN

12 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
ST PAUL MAINT YARD 1000 TN

13 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
LOUP CITY YARD 700 TN

14 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
HWY14 MP60 3MI S  AURORA 1000 TN

15 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
JCT 34 AND 81 2MI N OF YORK 1200 TN

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

Lyman Richey 
Corporation dba 
Central Sand & 

Gravel Company

AWARD
Matteo Sand & 

Gravel

Mid-Nebraska 
Aggregate Inc.

AWARD
Overton Sand & 

Gravel Co

AWARD
Pine Bluffs 

Gravel & Exc Inc

AWARD
Simon 

Contractors

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              26.10 

 $              21.94 

 $              21.04 

 $              16.80 

 $              18.78 

 $              17.28 

 $              19.50 

 $              18.50 

 $              18.50 



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
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 #

Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

16 DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY6 
MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 500 TN

17 DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
LOUP CITY YARD 500 TN

18 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 500 TN

19 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY281 MP7 2MI N OF RED CLOUD 1420 TN

20 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 
RAVENNA YARD 680 TN

21 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY281 MP95 1MI N OF ST PAUL 1000 TN

22 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY58 MP29 1MI N OF ROCKVILLE 1100 TN

23 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP320 1MI W OF LOUP CITY 550 TN

24 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL 
HARRISBURG YARD 2000 TN

25 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL 
CHAPPELL YARD 1000 TN

26 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
KIMBALL YARD 3000 TN

27 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
SIDNEY MAINT YARD 3000 TN

28 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
ALLIANCE YARD 1200 TN

29 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HARRISON YARD 2000 TN

30 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
CRAWFORD YARD 2000 TN

Lyman Richey 
Corporation dba 
Central Sand & 

Gravel Company

AWARD
Matteo Sand & 

Gravel

Mid-Nebraska 
Aggregate Inc.

AWARD
Overton Sand & 

Gravel Co

AWARD
Pine Bluffs 

Gravel & Exc Inc

AWARD
Simon 

Contractors

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              21.00 

 $              18.50 

 $              20.00 

 $              20.00 

 $              22.00 

 $              11.00  $                8.95 

 $              16.00  $              15.00 

 $              11.00  $              11.50 

 $              15.00  $              17.25 

 $              35.00  $              22.10 

 $              35.00  $              23.58 

 $              35.00  $              25.06 



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
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 #

Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

31 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY20 MP75 15MI E OF CHADRON 4000 TN

32 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY20 MP92 1MI E OF RUSHVILLE 1000 TN

33
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY71 MP110 26MI S OF CRAWFORD 3000 TN

34 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
HWY250 MP37 11MI S OF RUSHVILLE 1500 TN

35 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY385 MP149 18MI S OF CHADRON 2000 TN

36 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY385 MP141 26MI S OF CHADRON 2000 TN

37 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY26 MP88 2MI W OF LISCO 3000 TN

38 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY27 MP109 9MI S OF OSHKOSH 2000 TN

39 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY27 MP118 1MI S OF OSHKOSH 3000 TN

40 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY29 MP36 24MI N OF MITCHELL 1500 TN

41 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HARRISBURG YARD 1500 TN

42 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY71 MP90 27MI N OF 2000 TN

43 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY92 MP21 2MI W OF 1500 TN

44 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
KIMBALL YARD 3000 TN

45 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY27 MP92 10MI E OF CHAPPELL 2000 TN

Lyman Richey 
Corporation dba 
Central Sand & 

Gravel Company

AWARD
Matteo Sand & 

Gravel

Mid-Nebraska 
Aggregate Inc.

AWARD
Overton Sand & 

Gravel Co

AWARD
Pine Bluffs 

Gravel & Exc Inc

AWARD
Simon 

Contractors

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              35.00  $              38.00 

 $              35.00  $              32.50 

 $              35.00  $              20.52 

 $              35.00  $              34.20 

 $              35.00  $              26.17 

 $              35.00  $              25.25 

 $              35.00  $              22.60 

 $              35.00  $              18.13 

 $              35.00  $              18.92 

 $              28.00  $              17.26 

 $              25.00  $              15.63 

 $              28.00  $              16.55 

 $              25.00  $              13.75 

 $              15.00  $              19.74 

 $              17.00  $              18.18 
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 #

Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

46 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY30 MP55 3MI W OF SIDNEY 2000 TN

47 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY71 MP3 12S OF KIMBALL 2000 TN

48 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD 1000 TN

49 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
NORTH PLATTE I-80 YARD 1000 TN

50 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
SUTHERLAND MAINT YARD 1000 TN

51 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
ANSLEY MAINT YARD 1500 TN

52 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
OCONTO MAINT YARD 1500 TN

53 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
ARNOLD HWY92  MP251 1500 TN

54 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 1500 TN

55 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN 500 TN

56 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
ANSLEY HWY183 MP89 500 TN

57 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 500 TN

58 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY21 MP12 1MI N OF LEXINGTON 1000 TN

59 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY21 MP37 12MI N OF OCONTO 1000 TN

60 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN 1000 TN

Lyman Richey 
Corporation dba 
Central Sand & 

Gravel Company

AWARD
Matteo Sand & 

Gravel

Mid-Nebraska 
Aggregate Inc.

AWARD
Overton Sand & 

Gravel Co

AWARD
Pine Bluffs 

Gravel & Exc Inc

AWARD
Simon 

Contractors

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              16.00  $              22.25 

 $              16.00  $              22.55 

 $              12.00 

 $              12.00 

 $              12.00 

 $              11.20  $              24.00 

 $              11.20  $              24.00 

 $              14.50  $              18.00 

 $              10.75  $              20.00 

 $              20.00 

 $              14.90  $              30.00 

 $              14.15  $              28.00 

 $              10.50  $              28.00 

 $              13.50  $              30.00 

 $              30.00 
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Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

61 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY97 MP9 12MI N OF N PLATTE 2000 TN

62 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY23 MP56 DICKENS 2000 TN

63 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
GOTHENBURG YARD 750 TN

64 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
ANSLEY HWY183 MP89 750 TN

65 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
SARGENT YARD 750 TN

66 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
OCONTO JCT HWY21 AND 40 750 TN

67 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
ARNOLD HWY92  MP251 375 TN

68 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
ANSELMO HWY2 MP257 750 TN

69 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
BROKEN BOW HWY21 MP68 750 TN

70 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY2 AT DUNNING 750 TN

71 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY25 MP104 AT SUTHERLAND 2000 TN

72 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
LEXINGTON YARD 750 TN

73 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN 2500 TN

74 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON 2000 TN

75 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY83 MP130 18MI N STAPLETON 1000 TN

Lyman Richey 
Corporation dba 
Central Sand & 

Gravel Company

AWARD
Matteo Sand & 

Gravel

Mid-Nebraska 
Aggregate Inc.

AWARD
Overton Sand & 

Gravel Co

AWARD
Pine Bluffs 

Gravel & Exc Inc

AWARD
Simon 

Contractors

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              12.00 

 $              12.00 

 $              13.00 

 $              11.05  $              24.00 

 $              25.00 

 $              11.25  $              24.00 

 $              14.25  $              18.00 

 $              14.00  $              24.00 

 $              11.75  $              20.00 

 $              24.00 

 $              12.00  $              17.53 

 $                8.00  $              24.00 

 $              20.00 

 $              18.00 

 $              22.00 
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Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

76 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON 500 TN

77 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY2 MP176 10MI W OF MULLEN 1000 TN

78 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY61 MP126 1MI N ARTHUR 1000 TN

79 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY61 MP175 13MI N OF HYANNIS 1000 TN

80 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY61 MP131 7MI N ARTHUR 1000 TN

81 DIST 7 SURFACING GRAVEL 
HWY23 MP131 W END OF ELWOOD 1150 TN

82 DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY6 MP10 13MI W OF IMPERIAL 700 TN

83 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
SPRINGVIEW YARD 800 TN

84 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
AINSWORTH YARD 1500 TN

85 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
VALENTINE YARD 2000 TN

86 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
CODY YARD 500 TN

87 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
MERRIMAN YARD 2000 TN

88 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
HWY11 MP147 AT ATKINSON 500 TN

89 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
SPENCER YARD 500 TN

90 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
NORTH SPENCER YARD HWY281 700 TN

Lyman Richey 
Corporation dba 
Central Sand & 

Gravel Company

AWARD
Matteo Sand & 

Gravel

Mid-Nebraska 
Aggregate Inc.

AWARD
Overton Sand & 

Gravel Co

AWARD
Pine Bluffs 

Gravel & Exc Inc

AWARD
Simon 

Contractors

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              22.00 

 $              20.00 

 $              22.00  $              14.45 

 $              22.00  $              22.30 

 $              22.00  $              15.54 

 $                9.00 

 $              18.34 
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M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

91 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
BURWELL SOUTH YARD 1000 TN

92 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
BARTLETT YARD 2000 TN

93 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
TAYLOR YARD 1000 TN

94 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
O'NEILL YARD 1000 TN

95 DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY11 MP185 N OF BUTTE 2000 TN

96 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL 
SPRINGVIEW YARD 1000 TN

97 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY20 MP135 1MI W OF MERRIMAN 1200 TN

98 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY12 MP81 N BROCKSBURG 700 TN

99 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY12 MP102  8MI E OF NAPER 350 TN

100 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY281 MP212 AT SPENCER 350 TN

101 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY11 MP91 S OF BURWELL 700 TN

102 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY20 MP165 6MI E OF CODY 600 TN

103 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY12 MP19 1MI E OF SPARKS 600 TN

104 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY20 MP202 6MI E OF VALENTINE 1200 TN

105 OPTION 1: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
ARMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS

200 TN

Lyman Richey 
Corporation dba 
Central Sand & 

Gravel Company

AWARD
Matteo Sand & 

Gravel

Mid-Nebraska 
Aggregate Inc.

AWARD
Overton Sand & 

Gravel Co

AWARD
Pine Bluffs 

Gravel & Exc Inc

AWARD
Simon 

Contractors

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $                0.20  $                0.19 
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Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

106 OPTION 2: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 

200 TN

107 OPTION 3: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
WINDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 

200 TN

108 OPTION 4: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
SURFACING GRAVEL/ LOCATIONS 

200 TN

109 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY281 MP120 2MI N OF GREELEY 1200 TN

Total

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

Lyman Richey 
Corporation dba 
Central Sand & 

Gravel Company

AWARD
Matteo Sand & 

Gravel

Mid-Nebraska 
Aggregate Inc.

AWARD
Overton Sand & 

Gravel Co

AWARD
Pine Bluffs 

Gravel & Exc Inc

AWARD
Simon 

Contractors

 Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $                0.20  $                0.19 

 $                0.20  $                0.19 

 $                0.20 

0 30 N/A
45 30 60 Per ITB

Lines 105-108 
are per ton mile

Lines 105-108 ar 
per ton mile

 Award Explanation 
 The State has opted to award line 2 to Armstrong 
Rentals LLC due to it being a one line contract. 
Therefore, the State is consolidating that line into a 
larger contract.  



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
Department of Transportation

Opening Date:  02/06/20 
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Li
ne

 #

Description Qty UO
M

1 DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
WAHOO YARD 1200 TN

2 DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
EAST JCT HWY 15 AND 92 1500 TN

3 DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
PALMYRA YARD 1500 TN

4 DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL 
JCT HWY 8 AND 65 PAWNEE CITY 1500 TN

5 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
NELIGH YARD 2800 TN

6 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY57 8MI OF STANTON 1500 TN

7 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY121 JCT 121 AND 32 2200 TN

8 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY13 4MI N OF PIERCE 750 TN

9 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 
FULLERTON MAINT YARD 500 TN

10 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
ORD MAINT YARD 500 TN

11 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 
GREELEY YARD 300 TN

12 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
ST PAUL MAINT YARD 1000 TN

13 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
LOUP CITY YARD 700 TN

14 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
HWY14 MP60 3MI S  AURORA 1000 TN

15 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
JCT 34 AND 81 2MI N OF YORK 1200 TN

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

Southwest 
Gravel pro Inc.

Stalp Gravel, 
Inc.

AWARD
Ulrich Gravel Inc

Westover Rock 
& Sand Inc

 Unit price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              22.29 

 $              25.22 

 $              26.99 

 $              26.91  $              46.50 

 $              16.22 

 $              16.98  $              25.00 

 $              20.90 

 $              13.97 

 $              10.70 

 $              13.10 

 $              11.11 

 $              12.25 



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
Department of Transportation

Opening Date:  02/06/20 
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M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

16 DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY6 
MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 500 TN

17 DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
LOUP CITY YARD 500 TN

18 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 500 TN

19 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY281 MP7 2MI N OF RED CLOUD 1420 TN

20 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 
RAVENNA YARD 680 TN

21 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY281 MP95 1MI N OF ST PAUL 1000 TN

22 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY58 MP29 1MI N OF ROCKVILLE 1100 TN

23 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP320 1MI W OF LOUP CITY 550 TN

24 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL 
HARRISBURG YARD 2000 TN

25 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL 
CHAPPELL YARD 1000 TN

26 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
KIMBALL YARD 3000 TN

27 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
SIDNEY MAINT YARD 3000 TN

28 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
ALLIANCE YARD 1200 TN

29 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HARRISON YARD 2000 TN

30 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
CRAWFORD YARD 2000 TN

Southwest 
Gravel pro Inc.

Stalp Gravel, 
Inc.

AWARD
Ulrich Gravel Inc

Westover Rock 
& Sand Inc

 Unit price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              15.50 

 $              11.11 

 $              12.00 

 $              12.50 

 $              15.47 

 $              17.40 

 $              35.82 



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
Department of Transportation

Opening Date:  02/06/20 
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Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

31 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY20 MP75 15MI E OF CHADRON 4000 TN

32 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY20 MP92 1MI E OF RUSHVILLE 1000 TN

33
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY71 MP110 26MI S OF CRAWFORD 3000 TN

34 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
HWY250 MP37 11MI S OF RUSHVILLE 1500 TN

35 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY385 MP149 18MI S OF CHADRON 2000 TN

36 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY385 MP141 26MI S OF CHADRON 2000 TN

37 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY26 MP88 2MI W OF LISCO 3000 TN

38 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY27 MP109 9MI S OF OSHKOSH 2000 TN

39 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY27 MP118 1MI S OF OSHKOSH 3000 TN

40 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY29 MP36 24MI N OF MITCHELL 1500 TN

41 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HARRISBURG YARD 1500 TN

42 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY71 MP90 27MI N OF 2000 TN

43 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY92 MP21 2MI W OF 1500 TN

44 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
KIMBALL YARD 3000 TN

45 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY27 MP92 10MI E OF CHAPPELL 2000 TN

Southwest 
Gravel pro Inc.

Stalp Gravel, 
Inc.

AWARD
Ulrich Gravel Inc

Westover Rock 
& Sand Inc

 Unit price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              40.80 

 $              39.30 

 $              38.37 

 $              29.07 

 $              27.95 

 $              27.95 

 $              25.26 



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
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Description Qty UO
M

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

46 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY30 MP55 3MI W OF SIDNEY 2000 TN

47 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY71 MP3 12S OF KIMBALL 2000 TN

48 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD 1000 TN

49 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
NORTH PLATTE I-80 YARD 1000 TN

50 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
SUTHERLAND MAINT YARD 1000 TN

51 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
ANSLEY MAINT YARD 1500 TN

52 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
OCONTO MAINT YARD 1500 TN

53 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
ARNOLD HWY92  MP251 1500 TN

54 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL 
BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 1500 TN

55 DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN 500 TN

56 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
ANSLEY HWY183 MP89 500 TN

57 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 500 TN

58 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY21 MP12 1MI N OF LEXINGTON 1000 TN

59 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY21 MP37 12MI N OF OCONTO 1000 TN

60 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN 1000 TN

Southwest 
Gravel pro Inc.

Stalp Gravel, 
Inc.

AWARD
Ulrich Gravel Inc

Westover Rock 
& Sand Inc

 Unit price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              28.61 

 $                9.66 

 $              10.15 

 $                9.26 

 $              11.35 

 $              31.20 
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Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

61 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY97 MP9 12MI N OF N PLATTE 2000 TN

62 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY23 MP56 DICKENS 2000 TN

63 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
GOTHENBURG YARD 750 TN

64 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
ANSLEY HWY183 MP89 750 TN

65 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
SARGENT YARD 750 TN

66 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
OCONTO JCT HWY21 AND 40 750 TN

67 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
ARNOLD HWY92  MP251 375 TN

68 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
ANSELMO HWY2 MP257 750 TN

69 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
BROKEN BOW HWY21 MP68 750 TN

70 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY2 AT DUNNING 750 TN

71 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY25 MP104 AT SUTHERLAND 2000 TN

72 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
LEXINGTON YARD 750 TN

73 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN 2500 TN

74 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON 2000 TN

75 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY83 MP130 18MI N STAPLETON 1000 TN

Southwest 
Gravel pro Inc.

Stalp Gravel, 
Inc.

AWARD
Ulrich Gravel Inc

Westover Rock 
& Sand Inc

 Unit price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              17.59 

 $              11.35 

 $              10.10 



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
Department of Transportation

Opening Date:  02/06/20 
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Description Qty UO
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Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

76 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON 500 TN

77 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY2 MP176 10MI W OF MULLEN 1000 TN

78 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY61 MP126 1MI N ARTHUR 1000 TN

79 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY61 MP175 13MI N OF HYANNIS 1000 TN

80 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY61 MP131 7MI N ARTHUR 1000 TN

81 DIST 7 SURFACING GRAVEL 
HWY23 MP131 W END OF ELWOOD 1150 TN

82 DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY6 MP10 13MI W OF IMPERIAL 700 TN

83 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
SPRINGVIEW YARD 800 TN

84 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
AINSWORTH YARD 1500 TN

85 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
VALENTINE YARD 2000 TN

86 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
CODY YARD 500 TN

87 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
MERRIMAN YARD 2000 TN

88 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
HWY11 MP147 AT ATKINSON 500 TN

89 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
SPENCER YARD 500 TN

90 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
NORTH SPENCER YARD HWY281 700 TN

Southwest 
Gravel pro Inc.

Stalp Gravel, 
Inc.

AWARD
Ulrich Gravel Inc

Westover Rock 
& Sand Inc

 Unit price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              26.10 

 $              25.19 

 $              23.09 

 $              26.30 
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Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

91 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
BURWELL SOUTH YARD 1000 TN

92 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 
BARTLETT YARD 2000 TN

93 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
TAYLOR YARD 1000 TN

94 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
O'NEILL YARD 1000 TN

95 DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 
HWY11 MP185 N OF BUTTE 2000 TN

96 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL 
SPRINGVIEW YARD 1000 TN

97 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY20 MP135 1MI W OF MERRIMAN 1200 TN

98 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY12 MP81 N BROCKSBURG 700 TN

99 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY12 MP102  8MI E OF NAPER 350 TN

100 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY281 MP212 AT SPENCER 350 TN

101 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY11 MP91 S OF BURWELL 700 TN

102 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY20 MP165 6MI E OF CODY 600 TN

103 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY12 MP19 1MI E OF SPARKS 600 TN

104 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY20 MP202 6MI E OF VALENTINE 1200 TN

105 OPTION 1: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
ARMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS

200 TN

Southwest 
Gravel pro Inc.

Stalp Gravel, 
Inc.

AWARD
Ulrich Gravel Inc

Westover Rock 
& Sand Inc

 Unit price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $              11.75 

 $              10.95 

 $              11.75 

 $              11.75 

 $                0.19  $                0.20  $                0.15 



Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6203 OF Amended 4.6.20
Department of Transportation
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Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, 
and Surfacing Gravel

106 OPTION 2: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 

200 TN

107 OPTION 3: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
WINDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 

200 TN

108 OPTION 4: DELIVERY COST PER TON 
SURFACING GRAVEL/ LOCATIONS 

200 TN

109 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 
HWY281 MP120 2MI N OF GREELEY 1200 TN

Total

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

Southwest 
Gravel pro Inc.

Stalp Gravel, 
Inc.

AWARD
Ulrich Gravel Inc

Westover Rock 
& Sand Inc

 Unit price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $                0.19  $                0.15 

 $                0.19  $                0.15 

 $                0.19  $                0.15 

 $              12.75 

100 90
30 As needed

Line 105 is per 
ton/mile

 Award Explanation 
 The State has opted to award line 2 to Armstrong 
Rentals LLC due to it being a one line contract. 
Therefore, the State is consolidating that line into a 
larger contract.  
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